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North Gorham Public Library 
looking for volunteer readers
GORHAM, ME – 

We at North Gorham Pub-
lic Library are sad to an-
nounce that we had to say 
goodbye to Paula Boyce, 
who leads our weekly Sto-
ry Hour. She decided to ac-
cept a teaching position at 
a nearby college. Her shoes 
will be hard to fill, but if 
you’d like to try, please 
send us an email at libng@
north-gorham.lib.me.us

This is a volunteer 
position.

Story Hour is held ev-
ery Wednesday from 10:30 
to 11:30 in the library. It is 
geared toward toddlers and 

preschoolers, and features 
sing-alongs, reading a short 
story, and making a simple 
craft. The kids also usually 

play with the puzzles and 
toys we have on hand. We 
can have anywhere from 
two to 10 children.

Vendor applications open for Fall 
Fest & Makers Market in Gorham

GORHAM, ME –
Vendor applications are 
open for Fall Fest & Mak-
ers Market @ Orchard 

Ridge Farm in Gorham, 
ME Saturday, October 18th 
from 10 a.m. - 3 p.m. (rain 
or shine) 236 Sebago Lake 

Rd. 
You can apply at 

our Instagram and 
website. 

Join MDT Clean-Up Day – Help 
keep the Gorham trail beautiful!

GORHAM, ME –
Hello Friends! Mountain 
Division Trail is organiz-
ing a Trail Clean-Up Day 
and would love your help! 
Meeting Location: Where 
the trail crosses Wescott 
Rd, Gorham

Time: 8:00am to 
4:00pm on Saturday Sep-
tember 13.

We’ll head toward 

Otter Pond once we gather.
Tasks include:
Lopping
Raking
Leaf Blowing
Tools:
We’ll have some tools 

available, but feel free 
to bring your own. Use-
ful items include loppers, 
rakes, hedge trimmers, leaf 
blowers, and gloves.

Refreshments:
Water and snacks will 

be provided at the Wescott 
Rd meeting spot.

If you have any ques-
tions, please email us at fo-
tmdt@gmail.com. 

Thank you for help-
ing us keep the Mountain 
Division Trail safe, wel-
coming, and beautiful for 
all!

Town of Gorham seeks to fill 
committee, council seats

GORHAM, ME – 
The Municipal election 
will be held on Tuesday, 
November 4, 2025 for the 
purpose of electing:

 THREE (3) persons 
for Town Council to serve 
a 3 year term

TWO (2) persons for 
School Committee to serve 
a 3 year term

Nomination papers 

will be available from the 
Town Clerk’s Office begin-
ning on Monday, July 28, 
2025. Completed nomina-
tion papers must be sub-
mitted to the Town Clerk’s 
office no later than 5:00 
p.m. on Thursday, Septem-
ber 4, 2025.

Any registered 
voter of the Town of 
Gorham, who is interest-

ed in running for any of 
these positions, must sub-
mit nomination papers 
with no less than 35 or 
more than 50 signatures of 
persons who are registered 
voters of the Town of Gor-
ham.

Please contact the 
Town Clerk’s Office at 
222-1670 if you have any 
questions.

Clothes galore at Gorham’s 
Mission of Hope Clothes Closet

GORHAM, ME – 
The FREE Clothes Closet 
at Cressey Road Church 
(Mission of Hope Clothes 
Closet) is open to all who 
need Fellowship, Friend-
ship and Clothes. We are 
located at 81 Cressey 
Road, Gorham, and we 
are open on the FIRST and 
THIRD Saturday of each 
month from 9 o’clock AM 
to 12 Noon.

We focus on clothes 
and accessories (gloves, 
scarves, hats, etc.) and 
welcome your donations 
during our operating hours. 
Clean clothes in good 
shape help the most, as 
they go right out to help 
people locally or in nearby 
communities. An attempt 
is made to have season 
appropriate clothes avail-
able to you. After we have 

displayed them for a time, 
they are donated to our lo-
cal second-hand shops.

In addition to helping 
folks find clothes, we want 
to spend time with you! 
There are tables to sit, talk 
and to share a cup of coffee 
and usually a goodie with 
volunteers or others. Come 
see us! You might make a 
new friend. All are wel-
come!

St. Mary’s Chronic and Interventional Pain / Physiatry

team offers non-surgical care to help you move

better, feel stronger and get back to living. We treat a

wide range of conditions with personalized plans

that work for you.

Call 207-333-4799 to learn more.

Pain holding you back?
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A little good goes a long way: Give 
blood or platelets with Red Cross 

PORTLAND, ME – 
The American Red Cross 
asks donors to give blood 
or platelets now to help 
maintain a healthy blood 
supply. Donors of all blood 
types, especially those with 
types O positive and B 
negative blood, are urged 
to make an appointment 
to keep lifesaving blood 
products ready the moment 
patients need them.

People coming to-
gether to care for one an-
other is the humanitarian 
spirit shared by our Red 
Cross community and fans 
of PEANUTS. And this 
month, the Red Cross and 
PEANUTS are once again 
joining forces to remind 
people that a little good 
goes a long way. In cele-
bration of the 75th anniver-
sary of PEANUTS, those 
who come to give blood in 
September will get an ex-
clusive Red Cross x PEA-
NUTS mystery bag with 
one of four special T-shirt 
designs, while they last.

Each design is icon-
ic, and donors won’t know 
which one they’ll get until 
they open the bag. Addi-
tionally, there will be a 
number of golden tickets 
randomly in the mystery 
bags hidden throughout the 
country. Donors who find 
a golden ticket when they 
open their bag will have 
the chance to redeem it 

through an online form for 
all four T-shirts! See Red-
CrossBlood.org/Peanuts 
for details.

Be a friend to patients 
in need. Book a time to 
give by visiting RedCross-
Blood.org, downloading 
the Red Cross Blood Do-
nor App, or calling 1-800-
RED CROSS.

Seasonal challenges
Routines are chang-

ing, and schedules are fill-
ing up before fall, which 
could keep people from 
coming out to help save 
lives. In addition, the threat 
of severe weather and hur-
ricanes remains strong in 
late summer. As we near 
National Preparedness 
Month, it’s important to 
note the significant dis-
ruption weather can cause 
all year long. Between 
July 1, 2024, and June 30, 
2025, weather canceled 
about 1,500 blood drives, 
causing more than 40,000 
blood donations to go un-
collected. Making and 
keeping donation appoint-
ments where it’s safe to do 
so can help patients when 
and wherever they need it 
most.  

Upcoming blood do-
nation opportunities. 

Androscoggin
 Auburn
9/11/2025: 1 p.m. - 6 

p.m., Auburn Fire Depart-
ment, 550 Minot Avenue.

Poland
9/13/2025: 9 a.m. - 1 

p.m., Poland Town Hall, 
1223 Maine Street, Rt. 26.

Cumberland
Brunswick
9/10/2025: 12 p.m. 

- 5 p.m., Elks Lodge, 179 
Park Row.

Cape Elizabeth
9/11/2025: 1 p.m. - 5 

p.m., Saint Bartholomew 
Church, 8 Two Lights Rd.

Falmouth
9/10/2025: 10 a.m. - 2 

p.m., Lunt Auditorium, 74 
Lunt Road.

Gorham
9/4/2025: 1 p.m. - 

5:30 p.m., Cressey Road 
Christian Church, 81 
Cressey Road.

Portland
9/15/2025: 9 a.m. - 1 

p.m., Maine Medical Cen-
ter - Dana Education Cen-
ter, 22 Bramhall Street.

South Portland
9/9/2025: 9 a.m. - 1 

p.m., American Legion, 
413 Broadway.

Standish
9/15/2025: 9 a.m. - 1 

p.m., Standish Town Hall, 
175 Northeast Road.

Westbrook
9/12/2025: 12 p.m. 

- 4 p.m., Westbrook Com-
munity Center, 426 Bridge 
Street.

Yarmouth
9/5/2025: 11:30 a.m. 

- 4 p.m., American Legion 
Post 91, 196 Main St.

AARP News You Can Use –  
September 2025

By Joyce Bucciantini, 
AARP Maine Community 
Outreach Volunteer

On August 14,1935, 
President Franklin D. Roo-
sevelt signed the Social Se-
curity Act into law stating, 
“…we have tried to frame 
a law which will give some 
measure of protection to the 
average citizen and to his 
family against the loss of a 
job and against poverty-rid-
den old age.” Social Se-
curity created a system of 
earned retirement income 
for American workers to 
avoid the dire poverty ex-
perienced during the Great 
Depression.

I remember getting 
my first real paycheck and 
seeing the Social Security 
deduction. My father ex-
plained that paying into 
Social Security now cre-
ates an income benefit paid 
to us later. Being 17, later 
seemed a long way away. 
Like me, Social Security 
has seen a few changes over 
the years. Social Security 
has changed from just sup-
porting retired employees 
to also providing benefits to 
eligible spouses, children, 
people with disabilities and 
their families.

According to AARP, 
over 69 million Americans 
are receiving some type of 
Social Security. In Maine, 

95% of people over age 
65 receive Social Security 
benefits and rely on them 
to pay their everyday bills. 
Social Security benefits are 
not gifts; they are our own 
hard-earned money being 
paid back to us.

Full retirement age 
for Social Security depends 
on your age. For people 
born before 1958 the age 
is 65. For those young-
sters born between 1958 
and 1960, full retirement 
age is between 66 and 67. 
AARP and Social Security 
websites have information 
about Social Security eli-
gibility. Anyone can create 
an account at mysocialse-
curity.gov to monitor their 
Social Security benefits.

Part of our Social 
Security benefit is taxed 
based on our overall in-
come. However, the newest 
federal budget bill allows 
eligible seniors over 65 
who earn less than $75,000 
($150,000 for joint filers) 

to deduct $6,000 per indi-
vidual ($12,000/couple) 
from their overall taxable 
income. This tax deduction 
could reduce overall taxes 
for many older Americans. 
A qualified tax preparer can 
explain how this deduction 
impacts individual taxpay-
ers.

Social Security is a 
promise between workers 
and our government; em-
ployees pay into Social 
Security during their work-
ing years and receive an 
income based upon their 
earnings after retirement. 
For 90 years, Social Secu-
rity has kept that promise 
providing a crucial income 
source for retirees. AARP is 
committed to making sure 
our government keeps that 
promise whatever changes 
the next decades may bring. 
Happy Birthday to Social 
Security!

As always, check out 
the AARP Maine website 
for an AARP event near 
you. I hope to see you there!

Joyce Bucciantini is 
a retired middle school ed-
ucator. She currently coor-
dinates Delta Kappa Gam-
ma’s Read to Me program, 
is a tutor with Literacy Vol-
unteers-Androscoggin, and 
is an active AARP Maine 
volunteer. She enjoys her 
gardens, being outdoors 
and traveling.

Please use the fol-
lowing QR Code or web 
address to find more infor-
mation about AARP Maine 
and events near you:

aarp.org/me · me@
aarp.org · @aarpmaine · 
866-554-538.
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WHY PEOPLE CHOOSEWHY PEOPLE CHOOSE
   CHAMPOUX INSURANCE   CHAMPOUX INSURANCE

Voted by Market  
Study as Best  

Insurance Agency  
in Greater L/A for  

the 7th year  
running!

WHY PEOPLE CHOOSE
CHAMPOUX INSURANCE

STEPHEN NAGY
Personal Lines Agent

CHAMPOUX INSURANCE
DELIVERING ON THE PROMISE

416 Sabattus St. ~ Lewiston
(207) 783-2246

www.MaineInsuranceOnline.com

“I take the time to find
the most competitive and
comprehensive personal
insurance package for

each client. That’s how I
deliver on the promise.”

CHAMPOUX INSURANCE is pleased 

to announce that Dick Albert has 

re-joined the Agency Team at 

Champoux Insurance. Please give 

Dick a call and put his 30 years of 

experience to work for you.

Call Today

CHAMPOUX INSURANCE
DELIVERING ON THE PROMISE

150 East Avenue ~ Lewiston, ME 04240
(207) 783-2246

www.MaineInsuranceOnline.com

WHY PEOPLE CHOOSE
   CHAMPOUX INSURANCE

“Protecting your assets, by 
finding the right products and 
pricing, is how I deliver on the 
promise.”

Nicole Lajoie
Licensed Agent

Your SecuritY iS our Main concern

“I take the time to find the most 
comprehensive personal insurance 
package for each client. That’s how  
I deliver on the promise.”

STEPHEN NAGY
Personal Lines Agent

Friends of Feral Felines 
holding book sale

W E S T B R O O K , 
ME – The Friends of 
Feral Felines 22nd 
annual book sale is com-
ing to Westbrook again 
this year, to the very pop-
ular Westbrook Commu-
nity Center at 426 Bridge 
Street.  

The sale will run 
from 9am to 2pm on Satur-
day, September 20.  There 
will be hundreds of books, 
including top titles and 
great prices! 

Sales support Friends 

of Feral Felines ongoing 
mission to reduce the num-
ber of abandoned cats in 
southern Maine through 
Trap-Neuter-Release, so-

cialization, and forever 
homes, as well as provid-
ing food and medical care.

FMI: www.feralfe-
lines.net.

F&W Forestry expands 
operations in southern Maine
MAINE – F&W For-

estry Services, Inc., one 
of the nation’s oldest and 
largest forest management 
and consulting firms, is 
expanding its footprint in 
Maine through the acqui-
sition of Two Trees For-
estry.  The move strength-
ens F&W’s presence in 
the state and reinforces its 
commitment to high-qual-
ity, client-centric forestry 
services.  

Founded in 1984, 
Two Trees is a well-re-
spected provider of com-
prehensive forest manage-
ment services to private 
landowners and munici-
palities across central and 
southern Maine.  As part of 
the transition, Two Trees 
will retain its name and 
Harold Burnett, the com-
pany’s longtime owner, 
will continue to run the 
business, operating out of 
the Winthrop office. 

“As I began plan-
ning for retirement, it was 
important to find a partner 
that shares our environ-
mental ethics, professional 
standards, and dedication 

to client service,” said 
Burnett.  “F&W aligns per-
fectly with our values, and 
I believe our clients will 
experience a seamless tran-
sition with no disruption to 
the service they’ve come to 
expect.”

F&W, established in 
1962, is a trusted provider 
of high-quality, compre-
hensive forest management 
services to a diverse land-
owner base. Its expertise 
includes timber sales, man-
agement plans, property 
management, field support 
services, forest inventory 
and mapping, forestland 
accounting, technical and 
analytical services, real es-
tate, and natural capital.

“We are thrilled to 
welcome Two Trees to the 
F&W family,” said Mar-
shall Thomas, president of 
F&W.  “From our very first 
meeting, it was clear that 
Harold and his team exem-
plify the professionalism 
and client commitment that 
define our approach.”

F&W is committed 
to ensuring continuity for 
Two Trees’ clients, who 

will continue working with 
the same foresters and re-
ceiving the high level of 
service they have always 
valued and relied upon.

F&W currently man-
ages more than 40,000 
acres of Maine forestland 
through its Montpelier, 
Vermont office.  This stra-
tegic acquisition reflects 
the company’s ongoing 
investment in delivering 
top-tier forest management 
at the local level and ex-
panding its impact across 
the U.S.

Follow us on Facebook
www.facebook.com/GorhamWeekly

Fall book and bake sale
NEW GLOUCES-

TER, ME – The Friends of 
the New Gloucester Public 
Library are pleased to in-
vite the community to their 
annual Fall Book and Bake 
Sale on Sunday, Septem-
ber 14, 2025, from 12:00 
to 3:00 p.m. at the New 
Gloucester Community 
Building located at 381 
Intervale Road. A mem-
bers-only preview sale will 
be held that day from 11:00 
a.m. to 12:00 p.m. If you 
are not yet members of the 
Friends, we welcome you 
to join on the day of the 
event to gain early access 
and support the Library.

The Friends book and 
bake sale is a beloved New 
Gloucester tradition, dating 
back as early as the 1960s, 

when discarded library 
books were first offered for 
sale to raise funds. Today, 
the event brings residents 
together to browse gently 
used books while enjoying 
homemade cookies, cakes, 
and other baked treats.

Established in 1989, 
the Friends of the New 
Gloucester Public Library 
is a 501(c)(3) nonprofit 
organization dedicated to 
enhancing the Library’s 
programs and services. The 
Friends provide funding 
for events, materials, mu-
seum and park passes, and 
community engagement 
initiatives. Notable efforts 
have included landscaping 
projects, educational work-
shops, and participation in 
town-wide events such as 

the Community Fair and 
the annual Tiny Timber 
tree lighting.

For more informa-
tion or to learn how to 
become a member of the 
Friends, please visit the Li-
brary, the Friends website 
(www.friendsnewglouces-
terlibrary.org) or follow 
The Friends of the New 
Gloucester Public Library 
on social media.

Send all 
items for

What’s Going On
to the Editor.
Deadline is

Friday by five.



Page 4 Thursday, September 4, 2025

Open for curbside pick-up, take out, 
indoor dining, bowling and arcade!
Indoor AND outdoor dining!

Junction Bowl 
American pub-style food and drinks.

Curbside pickup 7 days a week.

Mon-Thur 3pm-10pm • Fri-Sun 11am-10pm

American pub-style food and drinks.

SCANSCAN
HERE!HERE!

1567 Lisbon Street Lewiston, Maine

The Place whereevery hour ishappy.
OPEN DAILY
11AM-9PM
DINE IN - TAKE OUT
207-777-6353
207-777-6354

• MULCH 
• LOAM 
• COMPOST 
• GRAVEL 
• STONE 
• SAND

1294 Sabattus Street
Lewiston

207-713-6090
Delivery Available

Also offering
residential & commercial 

lawn mowing services

Loading Hours:
M-Th by appointment

Fri - 8 am to 5 pm
Sat - 8 am to 2 pm

Sun - 8 am to Noon

Give Deer Spy a try!
Outdoor recreation 

and natural resources are 
truly at the center of our 
state’s identity. So many 
Maine memories are made 
through watching wildlife! 
Responsible wildlife man-
agement preserves these 
opportunities for future 
generations, and you can 
be a part of it.

Wildlife watching 
can be a wholesome hob-
by, serious science, or 
both at once! Deer Spy is 
a community science proj-
ect that invites all wildlife 
watchers to be a part of 
white-tailed deer manage-
ment in Maine. You don’t 
need to be a biologist; you 
just need to enjoy watching 
deer raise their families!

Participation is quick, 
easy, and rewarding. We 
are interested in all white-
tailed deer observations 
anywhere in Maine from 
August 1 through Septem-
ber 30. The next time you 
slow down to let a mama 
deer lead her fawns across 
the road, grab your bin-
oculars to watch does or 
a beautiful buck in your 
backyard, or witness some 
white-tails during your 
next outdoor adventure, 
all you need to do is fill 
out Maine Department of 
Inland Fisheries and Wild-
life’s online form with the 
following information. 

It’s as simple as that! 
Every time you share your 
sightings, you supply our 
biologists with statistics to 
better understand Maine’s 
white-tailed deer popula-
tion. The more eyes we 
have on Maine’s deer, the 
more we can fine-tune 
management and maintain 
a healthy herd. So join 
Maine’s team of communi-
ty scientists by giving Deer 
Spy a try during your next 
family excursion or out-
door adventure! 

Learn More About 
Deer Spy and Submit Ob-
servations

Did you capture a 
cool photo during Deer 
Spy?

Photos aren’t required 

to submit observations 
to Deer Spy, but partici-
pants often capture some 
neat moments. We’d love 
to share what you’ve seen 
with future Deer Spies! If 
you capture a photo you’d 
be happy to have us share 
on social media to highlight 
the rewarding community 
science experience, please 
email them to our Social 
Media Coordinator.

Photos must be your 
own or photos you have 
permission to share.

Photos must be of 
deer in Maine, preferably 
taken during Deer Spy 
(August/September)

Please include the 
photographer’s name so we 
can give appropriate credit!

Bonus points if you 
tell us a little about your 
experience participating in 
Deer Spy!

Love watching all 
kinds of wildlife?

The only thing better 
than watching wildlife in 
Maine is watching wild-
life in Maine for science! 
There are lots of opportuni-
ties for community science 
across our state throughout 
the year. The Wild Turkey 
August Production Survey 

is currently well underway, 
with turkey poult counts 
collected through the end 
of August. Learn about 
all of our current and past 
community science proj-
ects on our website.

Community Science 
can often be done right 
in your own backyard, 
but if you’re looking 
for a new place to ex-
plore, watch wildlife, 
and do some community 
science, find a Wildlife 
Management Area near 
you!

Funds support AmeriCorps 
Seniors programs in Maine

WA S H I N G T O N , 
D.C. – U.S. Senator Su-
san Collins, Chair of the 
Senate Appropriations 
Committee, announced 
that three organizations in 
Maine will receive a to-
tal of $1,373,395 through 
the Fiscal Year 2025 
AmeriCorps Seniors Fos-
ter Grandparent Program 
(FGP) and the Senior Com-
panion Program (SCP). 

The funding will support 
the work of 149 older vol-
unteers across the State of 
Maine who provide aid, 
companionship, and guid-
ance to seniors, young peo-
ple, and children.

“These grants will 
help older Mainers remain 
active and engaged in their 
communities while provid-
ing critical support to some 
of the most vulnerable 

people in our state,” said 
Senator Collins. “Whether 
it’s mentoring and provid-
ing guidance to students or 
helping older adults con-
tinue to live independent-
ly, foster grandparents and 
senior companions make a 
real difference in the lives 
of those they serve.”

The funding is allo-
cated as follows:

The Opportunity Alli-
ance (South Portland)

$583,373 Foster 
Grandparent Program 
award to support 65 volun-
teers.

Penquis CAP (Ban-
gor)

$399,717 Foster 
Grandparent Program 
award to support 44 volun-
teers

University of Maine 
System (Orono)

$390,305 Senior 
Companion Program 
award to support 40 volun-
teers

According to Amer-
iCorps, the FGP engages 
volunteers age 55 and over 
to serve in communities as 
role models, mentors, and 
friends to children. The 
SCP engages volunteers 
to provide assistance and 
companionship primarily 
to elderly individuals—and 
also to people with disabil-
ities—who have difficulty 
with daily living tasks.

Senator Collins is a 
longstanding member of 
the National Service Con-
gressional Caucus and has 
cosponsored legislation to 
exclude the AmeriCorps 
Education Award from fed-
eral income tax. In recog-
nition of her strong support 
for AmeriCorps, Senator 
Collins received the Ed-
ward M. Kennedy National 
Service Lifetime Leader-
ship Award in 2023. She 
joined a bipartisan group 
in introducing legislation 
to expand national service 
programs significantly to 
help the country recov-
er and rebuild from the 
COVID-19 public health 
emergency.
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No money down. 
FREE estimates.
Schedule your new 
garage install today!

100% Financed Garages!

(207) 500-8100 ~ www.AmericanBuilders.com

Seniors Not Acting Their Age
Dyer Long Pond is a Serene Hidden Gem

A group of paddlers navigate north on Dyer Long Pond A kayaker explores a swampy area in the northern part of 
Dyer Long Pond

Paddlers investigate the dam at the southern outlet

Two kayakers travel south on Dyer Long Pond

I “discovered” Dyer 
Long Pond in Jefferson 
while studying my Delo-
rme Maine Atlas for pro-
spective lakes and ponds to 
explore in central Maine.  
A banana shaped body of 
water with several inlets, 
coves and small penin-
sulas, the approximately 
3-mile long pond appeared 
to be an excellent paddling 
destination.

Dyer Long Pond is 
situated in a remote wil-
derness area of Jefferson 
that is off the beaten path.  
On the map, it looks like 
one of those locations that 
qualifies for the phrase, 
“you can’t get there from 
here.”  There is a State 
of Maine designated 
hand-carry boat landing 
on the western shore at the 
approximate midpoint in 
the pond.

When my wife, Nan-
cy, and I decided to paddle 
the intriguing pond on a 
hot, sunny late-July day 
with light northerly winds 
predicted, we extended an 
invitation to several fre-
quent paddling compan-
ions.  Four enthusiastic 
boaters agreed to join us 
on short notice.

Locating the boat 
landing on Dyer Long 
Pond required some inves-
tigation.  Traveling Route 
215 south from Cooper’s 
Mills in Jefferson, turn left 
onto Hinks Road and fol-
low it for about one-half 
mile to a boat landing sign 
on the right.  A lengthy dirt 
road continues to the land-
ing where there is ample 
parking and a paved load-
ing zone.

We launched a tan-
dem canoe and four solo 

kayaks on the mirror calm 
pond and began traveling 
north along the west shore.  
Several small homes and 
cottages were passed but 
no activity was observed.  
The pond remained very 
quiet throughout our voy-
age.

The northern end of 
the pond is undeveloped 
and ripe for exploration.  
Two of us found a small 
brook that feeds the pond 
from the north and began 
a reconnaissance.  Guard-
ed by a field of lily pads 
and thick swamp grass, 
we reached a point of no 
return after persisting for 
a modest distance in a nar-
row twisting channel.  Pur-
ple Loosestrife colorfully 
decorated the marshy area.  
Unfortunately, the peren-
nial herb is an invasive 
species and poses a threat 
to wetland ecosystems by 
outcompeting native veg-
etation and reducing the 
habitat for wildlife.

After regrouping 
along a wooded section 
on the northern shore, the 
entire entourage began 
paddling south along the 
east shore past a handful 
of cottages, many embed-
ded into a relatively steep 
embankment.  Again, the 
camps were remarkably 
quiet. 

At the approximate 
midway point, we tra-
versed west across the 
pond and stopped at the 
boat landing for a lunch 
break.  While there, a solo 
kayaker launched into the 
pond and two fishermen 
arrived to test their luck 
from shore.

With the exception 
of a few cottages on the 

west shore, the southern 
half of the pond is largely 
undeveloped.  We passed 
a prominent peninsula on 
the east side and entered 
a narrowing body of water 
where extensive swamp 
grass dominates the west-
ern shoreline.

Progressing south, 
we navigated through a 
twisting attenuated pas-
sage to an old dam at the 
southern outlet.  When 
paddling closer to inspect, 
the deteriorating structure 
was obviously in poor 
condition.  Debris had ac-
cumulated at the rim and 
manually adding and re-
moving boards from slots 
in the dam appear to be the 
method used to manage 
the pond level.  The land 
around the dam is posted 
so we were unable to in-
vestigate further.

According to my re-
search, approximately 10 
years ago a dispute arose 
about maintaining accept-
able water levels on the 
pond.  In 2018, the Maine 
DEP held a hearing in Jef-
ferson concerning the mat-
ter.  According to a news 
report, camp owners be-
lieved the dam owner was 
allowing the pond level to 
drop too low.  It’s unclear 
if the issue was resolved, 
but the water level seemed 
adequate during our trip.  
However, it does not ap-
pear the aging dam allows 
for migration of alewives 
into the pond.

Our return trip was 
a delight.  A light head-
wind provided relief from 
the hot, steamy weather 
as we slowed our pace to 
take full advantage of the 

exceptional scenery and 
serene environment.

The lone kayaker 
met earlier was the only 
boater seen during our 
voyage.  I recommend 
Dyer Long Pond for pad-
dlers in search of a quiet 
scenic lake or pond trip in 
central Maine.

My book, Maine Al 
Fresco:  The Fifty Finest 
Outdoor Adventures in 
Maine devotes 28 chap-
ters to paddling Maine’s 
lakes, ponds, rivers, and 
the coastline.

Ron Chase resides 
in Topsham.  His latest 
book, “Maine Al Fresco:  
The Fifty Finest Outdoor 
Adventures in Maine” is 
available at www.north-
countrypress.com/maine-
al-fresco or in bookstores 
and through online retail-
ers.  His previous books 
are “The Great Mars 
Hill Bank Robbery” and 
“Mountains for Mortals – 
New England.”  Visit his 
website at www.ronchase-
outdoors.com or he can be 
reached at ronchaseout-
doors@comcast.net.
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ThePublicTheatre.org 
782-3200

A CO-PRODUCTION

Sept 4,

SPONSORS: Schooner Estates; Sandy Morrell-Rooney & Chuck Rooney
All performances at 31 Maple St, Lewiston

TICKETS:
$45-60
We,Fr,Sa - 7pm
Th,Sa,Su - 2pm

Aug 27 - Sep 14

A heartfelt musical tribute to 
the Irish-American experience. NOW PLAYING!

Best Seats
Evenings Lakes Region Senior Center 

invites Gorham seniors to activities
GORHAM, ME – If 

you are looking for a fun 
senior center with lots of 
activities daily, come join 
us at Little Falls Activity 

Center, 40 Acorn Street, 
Gorham, Maine.  We are 
open from 8:30 to 2 or 3 pm 
depending on the activity.  
Our calendar is online.  

Call Gerry Day, Pres-
ident, at 839-3859 for more 
information  

Membership fee is 
$20 a year with many perks.  

Local Oldies Dance Group raises 
$5K for Ronald McDonald House

The 26th Rock n’ Roll Oldies Benefit Dance will be held from 
7 p.m. to midnight on Saturday, Oct. 18 at the Eagle’s Hall 
in Biddeford.

MAINE – Rock n’ 
roll music’s abiding pop-
ularity is the driving force 
for the Oldies Dance 
Group, whose ongoing 
mission is to support the 
Ronald McDonald House 
of Portland.

The organization’s 
25th dance on April 19 in 
Biddeford sold 301 tick-
ets in just seven days and 
earned $5,316, pushing 
the total amount that the 
Oldies Dance Group has 
raised in 17 years for the 
Ronald McDonald House 
to $129,814. The Ronald 
McDonald House provides 
comfort for the families of 
pediatric patients in Maine 
and supports programs that 
directly improve the health 
and well-being of children 
and enables family cen-
tered care to ensure that 
family members are fully 
supported and actively in-
volved in their child’s care.

“This is really an 
achievement of everyone 
who has attended the danc-
es staged by the Oldies 
Dance Group through the 
years and to all the individ-
uals and businesses who 
remain steadfast in their 
commitment to assisting 
the sick children and their 
families of the Ronald 
McDonald House of Port-
land,” said Bruce Martin, 
Oldies Dance Group orga-
nizer. “We are grateful to 
have this support and deep-
ly humbled that through 
the years, the Oldies Dance 
Group has shattered the 
$129,000 donation thresh-
old.”

Martin said the danc-
es are held twice a year in 
the spring and in the fall 
and are more than just typi-
cal fundraisers.

“For those who grew 
up with great rock n’ roll 
tunes as the soundtrack of 
their lives, these dances 

are such a wonderful social 
event,” Martin said. “The 
music is familiar to every-
one, and it energizes peo-
ple to get up on the dance 
floor while others just en-
joy visiting and socializing 
with their friends during 
the evening.”

He said demand 
for dance tickets is over-
whelming and in between 
the dances in the spring and 
fall he receives hundreds of 
phone calls from through-
out Maine and nearby 
states from individuals 
seeking to purchase tickets.

“I think it’s because 
rock n’ roll music truly 
connects people of all ages 
and walks of life,” Martin 
said. “The dances are fun 
and filled with songs that 
really get people out of 
their seats and up onto the 
dance floor.”

Businesses and indi-
viduals making donations 
for the April dance include 
Bill Dodge; Napa Sanel; 
Advance Auto; Tractor 
Supply; Community Phar-
macy; Saloon Color & Cut; 
Dickerson’s Candy; All 
About Time; Gorham Sand 
& Gravel; Copy It; and the 
Fraternal Order of Eagles.

Also making dona-
tions to the April dance 
were Georges Sandwiches; 

Bob’s & Mikes Mini Mart; 
Arctic Glacier Ice; Cador-
ette/HVAC; M/M Beeman; 
Janet Sparkowich; Chris 
and Shonna Eisenhower; 
and Ed’s Grove.

The next Rock n’ Roll 
Oldies Benefit Dance will 
be the 26th dance hosted 
by the Oldies Dance Group 
and will be held from 7 
p.m. to midnight Saturday, 
Oct. 18 at the Eagle’s Hall, 
57 Birch St., Biddeford.

Tickets are just $15 
and sell out quickly as seat-
ing is limited.

“I always say to ev-
eryone that if you’re think-
ing about attending the 
next dance, I encourage 
you to call soon because 
these tickets sell out in just 
a few days,” Martin said. 
“When the tickets are sold 
out, they’re gone, and we 
have a waiting list should 
something suddenly be-
come available. This is one 
of the most popular events 
in Southern Maine and it’s 
truly telling just how pop-
ular these dances are and 
how much people love 
rock n’ roll music.”

For further details, 
to purchase tickets for the 
upcoming Rock n’ Roll 
Oldies Benefit Dance, or to 
volunteer to help, call 207-
284-4692.

Ash Seed Collecting Workshop 
with PRLT

NORTH YAR-
MOUTH, ME – Join Pre-
sumpscot Regional Land 
Trust for a hands-on Ash 
Seed Collection Workshop, 
the third event in The Ash 
Tree Stewardship & Edu-
cation Program, a four-part 
series of educational walks 
designed to raise public 
awareness and encourage 
stewardship of ash trees. 
Ash trees are vital to the 
health of our forests and 
hold deep cultural signif-
icance for the Wabanaki 
people, who have long 
relied on Brown Ash for 
basket making. Today, ash 
trees are critically threat-
ened by the invasive emer-
ald ash borer beetle. 

During this work-
shop, we’ll go over ash 
tree identification and 
seed-collection techniques 
and equipment before hik-
ing off-trail into the flood-
plain forest. There, we will 
search for seed-bearing ash 
trees and split into groups 
to collect seeds together. 
Binoculars are recom-

mended for spotting seed 
clusters high in the canopy, 
and long pants are encour-
aged, as there may be some 
poison ivy. 

This event is co-host-
ed by the Wild Seed Proj-
ect, Royal River Conserva-
tion Trust, and Royal River 
Conservation Trust, and is 
part of the larger statewide 
efforts of the Ash Protec-
tion Collaboration Across 
Wabanakik (APCAW). 
Each walk in the series will 
equip participants with 
practical skills they can 
apply in their own forests 
and communities to help 
protect and preserve ash in 
Maine. 

 Parking for Dunn’s 

Depot Trail is available 
at the Town of North Yar-
mouth’s Route 9 boat 
launch site (512 Memori-
al Highway), next to Old 
Town House Park. Once 
the lot is full, park along 
the shoulder of Route 9, on 
the same side of the road 
as the boat launch. Get the 
address and register with 
the Presumpscot Regional 
Land Trust for GPS Ad-
dress. Carpooling is en-
couraged! 

Ash Seed Collecting 
Workshop.

Thursday, September 
11th, 4-6 pm.

Dunn’s Depot Pre-
serve, Royal River Conser-
vation Trust.
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5K RUN START

Staging begins 15 minutes prior to departure.

PACKET PICK-UP
Simard-Payne Park
46 Beech Street  |  Lewiston, Maine

4:00 PM - 
7:00 PM

12:00 PM - 
6:00 PM

NIGHT OF LOVE + LIGHT
Royal Oak Room  |  Lewiston, Maine
Celebrate this year’s top fundraisers. By invitation only.

6:00 PM -
8:00 PM

7:00 AM OPENING REMARKS
Oxford Street Start Stage

7:30 AM 65-MI, 50-MI, + GRAVEL RIDES START

18
SEPT

THURS

PACKET PICK-UP
Simard-Payne Park
46 Beech Street  |  Lewiston, Maine19

SEPT

FRI

20
SEPT

SAT

4:00 PM - 
6:00 PM

PARTY IN THE PARK
Simard-Payne Park
Tune your bike with the Maine Bike Coalition, get your
incentives, enjoy live music, and party with other
Challengers to kick-off the weekend! Featuring Baxter
Brewing.

Thank you to everyone taking on the Dempsey Challenge presented by Hearts of Pine. All proceeds from all
Dempsey Challenge Weekend events go directly to the services offered by the Dempsey Center, making life better
for people impacted by cancer. Learn more at www.DempseyCenter.org

7:45 AM 10K RUN START
Staging begins 15 minutes prior to departure.

8:15 AM
Staging begins 15 minutes prior to departure.

8:25 AM 5K WALK START
Staging begins 15 minutes prior to departure.

9:20 AM

WENDY’S WAY RIDE START
Staging begins 15 minutes prior to departure.

11:00 AM KIDS’ FUN RUN
Oxford Street Start Line

1:00 PM HONOR WALK
Main Stage

W
W

W
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Y
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G
E
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R
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9:35 AM

Pick up your bib, t-shirt, water bottle, and turn in any
last minute funds.

presented by Concentra

7:30 AM FESTIVAL IN THE PARK OPENS
Simard-Payne Park. Open to the Public!

25-MILE RIDE START
Staging begins 15 minutes prior to departure.

Highlights from last 
year!
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(207) 225-5627

Burglar Alarms 

Fire Alarms • Cameras 

Smarthome services 

Card Access  

Commercial 

Residential

Congratulations to the participants 
of the Dempsey Challenge, You rock!

Locally Owned
Locally Operated

855-740-6794
BuildingControlsMaine.com

Fire Alarms 
Video Systems

Intrusion Alarms 
Access Control

Commercial
Residential 

Are you up for the Challenge?
Each September, thou-

sands of people break out 
their inner athletes and chal-
lenge themselves to take on 
a walk, run, or ride event 
to help make life better for 
people impacted by cancer 
by taking on the Dempsey 
Challenge.

100% of funds raised 
by Challenge participants 
provide personalized, ho-
listic services at no cost to 
cancer patients, survivors, 
care partners, bereaved in-
dividuals, families, and oth-
er loved ones. Founded by 
actor Patrick Dempsey, this 
flagship fundraising event 
has raised nearly $20 mil-
lion since its inception.

Register at https://
www.dempseycenter.org/
dempsey-challenge/

Celebrate, Honor, and 
Rally… Together.

Dempsey Challenge 
Weekend is a time to come 
together, both in-person and 
virtually, to show support 
for the clients supported by 
the Dempsey Center.

Challengers come 
together to RALLY in the 
event that means the most 
to them; to CELEBRATE 
everyone’s hard work train-
ing and fundraising to reach 
their goals; and to HONOR 
those impacted by cancer’s 
over-arching reach into their 
lives.

Your Support is Mak-
ing a Difference

Taking on the 
Dempsey Challenge is more 
than participating in a 5k 
or cycling event. Taking 
on the Dempsey Challenge 
is becoming a part of the 
Dempsey Center communi-
ty and committing to mak-
ing life better for people 
impacted by cancer.

When you become a 
Challenger, you immediate-
ly start making a difference. 
Every single dollar you raise 
goes directly to the services 
provided at the Dempsey 
Center. Learn more about 
all of our services at the 
Dempsey Center website.

Participate in-person or virtually!
OPPORTUNITIES 

FOR EVERYONE
Register for our 

in-person Dempsey Chal-
lenge event or virtually  
(participate anytime, any-
where) or as a volunteer. 
There are no barriers to 
joining in and no limits to 
what’s possible when we 
- as a global community 
- CHALLENGE OUR-
SELVES to support people 
impacted by cancer. 

	 IN-PERSON
Our in-person event is 

located in Lewiston, Maine 
and features 5K/10K run/
walk and ride events on 
Saturday, September 20th

Dempsey Challenge 
Registration Includes: Par-
ticipant t-shirt; Fundrais-
ing Incentives; Fundraising 
Guide to help you achieve 
your fundraising goals!; 
Beverage ticket to enjoy 
a Maine craft beer, mi-
mosa or bloody Mary (or 
Colton + Levi’s Lemonade 
Stand!); Maine-inspired 
finisher meal in the Food + 
Beverage Tent

VIRTUAL EVENT
Our virtual event is 

also completed on Septem-
ber 20th, anywhere and in 
any way you choose!

Virtual Dempsey 
Challenge Registration 
Includes: Official bib, 
shipped to you; Fundrais-

ing Incentives, shipped to 
you; Exclusive Finisher 
Medal, shipped to you; 
Fundraising Guide to help 
you achieve your fundrais-
ing goals!

C H A L L E N G E 
YOURSELF

Four easy steps to get 
in on the fun!

1. Choose Your Chal-
lenge

We offer different 
participation levels suited 
for all skill levels: Walk/
Run a  5K or Run a 10K. 
Ride 10mi (Wendy’s Way), 
25mi, 50mi, or 65mi cyling 
road routes OR Challenge 
Yourself with an advanced 
52mi gravel ride!

Virtual Participants 
can participate in any ac-
tivity from anywhere in the 
world - and support people 
impacted by cancer.

2. Register
Registration is cur-

rently open.  When register-
ing as an adult participant, 
you’re committing to a 
fundraising minimum. For 
more details, see the regis-
tration website.

3. Choose a Team 
Type

Participate on your 
own, join a team, or create 
your own team.

About Teams: There 
is no limit to how many 
members can be on a team. 

Teams can be a mix of 
walkers, runners, riders, 
and virtual participants. 
Each team member is re-
sponsible for their own 
fundraising minimum for 
their chosen event.

4. Fundraise
Fundraising com-

mitments vary by event 
but participants have until 
event day, September 20th, 
to meet or exceed their 
minimum. Your commit-
ment and generosity sup-
ports the Dempsey Center’s 
mission to make life better 
for people managing a can-
cer impact.

KEY DATES
Friday, September 12, 

2025 5:00 PM ET: Team 
Packet Pickup registra-
tion deadline; Registration 
change deadline

Thursday, September 
18, 2025 12:00 PM ET: 
Deadline to be recognized 
as Dempsey Challenge in-
dividual or team award win-
ner*; Deadline for College 
Cup and High School Chal-
lenge*; Deadline to raise 
$3,000+ to receive A Night 
of Love + Light Champion 
event invitation*

September 20, 2025 
5:00 PM ET: Final incen-
tive deadline

*All funds must be re-
ceived by the deadline date 
and time.
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Call 207.784.3200 or visit sta-law.com

Over 160 years of 
commitment to 
clients, cases, and 
community.

500 Canal Street, Lewiston, Maine

This year’s incentives
Taking on the 

Dempsey Challenge 
means ensuring that peo-
ple throughout Maine and 
across the United States 
have access to high-quality 
supportive care throughout 
their cancer journey—all 
at no cost. Each and every 
Challenger works hard to 
Challenge Themselves to 
raise money in support of 
this mission...and while 
that in and of itself is an 
incentive, a little gift of 

thanks doesn’t hurt! 
We’re thrilled to 

share some amazing in-
centives from our incred-
ible partners for the 2025 
Dempsey Challenge, pre-
sented by @hearts_sc! 

What incentive do 
you hope to earn this year?! 

In-person Challeng-
ers will be able to pick up 
their incentives either at 
the Party in the Park on 
Friday, September 19th 
from 4-6pm or throughout 

the day in Simard-Payne 
Park on September 20th. 
Virtual Challengers are 
also eligible for incentives, 
and those will be mailed to 
your registration address 
following Challenge week-
end.

From all of us here 
at the Dempsey Center—
thank you. Thank you for 
registering for Challenge, 
for fundraising, and for 
making life better for peo-
ple impacted by cancer.

207-939-8970

Specializing in
bank owned

homes.
NOW HIRING

sales agents 
and brokers!

danthemanmaine.com

1 Annual Percentage Rate as of 7/18/2025. Rates subject to change without notice. Not all 
applicants will qualify for the lowest rate or be approved. Advertised rate is based on risk 

based & relationship pricing discounts. For more information, visit egcu.org/rec.

egcu.org/rec

Rec Loans
Scan to apply

or call
207-221-5000

Rates as low as

55 ..4949 APR1
%
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24' x 24' -  2 bedroom cabin with a loft bumpout 
addition (8’ x 14’) with bathroom and shower. 
Power, new propane heater installed, new well and 
septic, new 8’ x 12’ deck, 4 acres of land, abundant 
with wildlife, washer and dryer hook up, new driveway, 
stumped and leveled off yard, direct ATV access.

$380,000

CAMP FOR SALE 
by owner

Thurston Rd, Cornville

For more 
information
Call 207-215-3557

TurfMutt: Fall is the most 
important season for your yard

A L E X A N D R I A , 
VA – For 15 years, the 
TurfMutt Foundation has 
encouraged people to 
get outside, care for, and 
enjoy their own family 
backyards, parks and com-
munity green spaces. As 
autumn approaches, there’s 
no better time than now to 
plan for next spring and 
summer. 

“Now that fall is just 
around the corner, our 
best advice is to just keep 
going,” said Kris Kiser, 
President & CEO of the 
TurfMutt Foundation. 
“Fall is a great season for 
getting outside with the 
more moderate tempera-
tures and changing foli-
age but it’s also the time 
of year to prepare trees, 
shrubs, grass and gardens 
to better weather the colder 
months.”

Kiser added that it 
is important not to sleep 
on autumn yardwork. “Do 
not put your outdoor pow-
er equipment away just 
yet,” he advised. “Fall is 
the most critical season for 
your outdoor living room. 
What you do now will 
set the tone for what your 
yard will look like and 
how healthy it will be next 
spring.” 

Here are just a few 
ways the TurfMutt Foun-
dation suggests sprucing 
up and enjoying your fami-
ly yard this fall: 

Create a Fall Yard-
work Checklist. As long as 
your grass is growing, keep 
mowing. Other important 
to-dos include aerating 
your lawn, overseeding, 
cleaning out flower beds, 

trimming back perennials, 
and adding a fresh lay-
er of mulch around trees 
and shrubs to protect them 
during the winter months. 

Feed Your Lawn, 
Naturally. When au-
tumn leaves fall, consider 
mulching them with your 
lawnmower instead of rak-
ing and disposing of them. 
This will not only keep 
yard waste out of the local 
landfill, it also adds organ-
ic matter back into the soil. 

Plant Bulbs Using the 
“Right Plant, Right Place” 
Principle. Fall is an ideal 
time to plant many spring 
flower bulbs. Select those 
that will thrive in your re-
gion by checking out the 
USDA Plant Hardiness 
Zone Map. By choosing 
the right plants for your 
climate and lifestyle, you’ll 
be rewarded with a beauti-
ful and purposeful green 
space your entire family 
will enjoy year-round. 

Embrace Outdoor 
Living (and Working). In 
many areas of the coun-
try, fall means a respite 
from scorching tempera-
tures and an opportunity 
to really embrace outdoor 
living. Fall allows families 

to transition even more ev-
eryday activities like din-
ing, studying, working, and 
relaxing outside. 

Personalize Leaf 
Peeping Season. There’s 
no need to fight the crowds 
to enjoy the fall foliage if 
you plant trees that change 
color. Or you can experi-
ence the glory of fall by 
taking a family walk to a 
neighborhood park or nat-
ural area.

 Check out the Turf-
Mutt Foundation’s In-
ternational Backyarding 
Fact Book to learn more 
about the power of parks, 
backyards and other green 
space around us. Sign up 
for Mutt Mail, a monthly 
e-newsletter with “back-
yarding” tips and all the 
news from the TurfMutt 
Foundation.

Send all 
items for

What’s Going On
to the Editor.
Deadline is

Friday by five.

Plant Disease Diagnostic Lab 
achieves national accreditation

ORONO, ME – The 
University of Maine Co-
operative Extension Plant 
Disease Diagnostic Lab 
recently achieved Core 
Accreditation through the 
National Plant Diagnostic 
Network (NPDN). This 
designation highlights the 
lab’s commitment to excel-
lence in plant disease diag-
nostics and its vital role in 
supporting plant health and 
biosecurity across Maine 
and the northeastern U.S.

Led by Assistant Di-
agnostician Stephanie Shea 
and Director Alicyn Smart, 
the lab joins an elite net-
work of diagnostic facili-
ties nationwide that meet 
rigorous standards set by 
the NPDN Core Accredi-
tation Program, making it 
the second land-grant Uni-
versity to achieve this des-
ignation.

“This milestone rec-
ognizes our lab’s dedica-
tion to high-quality diag-

nostics and continuous 
improvement,” said Smart. 
“It reflects the hard work of 
our team and our responsi-
bility in protecting Maine’s 
agriculture and ecosystems 
from invasive pests and 
pathogens.”

The NPDN Core 
Accreditation Program 
provides a framework for 
diagnostic labs to develop 
and implement a compre-
hensive quality manage-
ment system. This ensures 
consistent accuracy, pro-
fessionalism and prepared-
ness across the network. 
Core Accreditation means 
that the UMaine Extension 
lab has successfully met 
quality standards in areas 
such as diagnostic proto-
cols and standard operat-
ing procedures; equipment 
maintenance and calibra-
tion; data management and 
recordkeeping; staff train-
ing and proficiency testing; 
and risk mitigation and bi-

osecurity practices.
As part of the NPDN, 

which includes over 70 
labs across the U.S., the 
UMaine Extension Plant 
Disease Diagnostic Lab 
plays a critical role in ear-
ly detection and response 
to emerging plant threats 
such as beech leaf disease. 

“By achieving Core 
Accreditation, our lab 
strengthens Maine’s read-
iness to respond to plant 
health threats quickly and 
effectively,” said Shea. 
“We’re proud to contribute 
to national diagnostic ex-
cellence and safeguard the 
region’s agricultural econ-
omy and environment.”

The lab provides di-
agnostic services to grow-
ers, homeowners, industry 
professionals and govern-
ment agencies. In addition 
to diagnostics, it supports 
plant health through edu-
cational outreach, applied 
research and collaborations 
with the U.S. Department 
of Agriculture Animal and 
Plant Health Inspection 
Service, Maine Depart-
ment of Agriculture, Con-
servation and Forestry, and 
other regional partners.

For more informa-
tion about the UMaine 
Extension Plant Disease 
Diagnostic Lab and its 
services, visit the program 
webpage.
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• Landscaping
• Hardscape
• Drainage Installs
• Retaining Walls
• Mowing
• Snow Plowing
• and more!

207-344-5212

Chimneys • Chimney Cleanings • Masonry Demo

Black-Brown $45/yard

Playground Chips $25/yard

Reground Chips $40/yard

(all natural) 

Screened Loam

Delivery Available!
642-6181 ~776-1063 ~ 415-2781

RICHARD WING & SON LOGGING
RT 114, 610 Richville Road, Standish, Maine

MULCH

Midcoast Symphony Orchestra 
presents 36th season 

Jinwook Park (photo credit 
Susan Wilson)

Philip Lima (photo credit 
Susan Wilson)

Roselin Osser (photo credit Ars Magna Studio) 

TOPSHAM, ME –
Coming off a highly suc-
cessful 35th-anniversary 
year that drew its largest 
audiences since before the 
pandemic, the Midcoast 
Symphony Orchestra is ex-
cited to announce its 2025-
26 season, “Celebrating 
the Human Spirit.” Four 
programs are planned, each 
presented on Saturdays at 
7:00pm in Lewiston/Au-
burn, and at 2:30pm on 
Sundays in Topsham.

Music Director Ro-
han Smith, currently in 
his 22nd year guiding the 
MSO, conducts the con-
certs in October, January, 
and May, while guest con-
ductor Jinwook Park takes 
the podium for the March 
concerts. Other guest art-
ists this season include 
baritone Philip Lima in 
October, previously heard 
with Midcoast as soloist 
in songs by Copland and 
Mahler; the pianist Morgan 
Lee, playing Beethoven’s 
Fourth Piano Concerto on 
the March program; and, 
as part of the large forces 
that will be assembled for 
Mahler’s “Resurrection” 
symphony in May, the 
mezzo-soprano Roselin 
Osser, soprano Jessica 
Kenlan, and choir direc-
tor Zen Kurimaya. Season 
tickets are now on sale for 
$80 at midcoastsymphony.
org or by calling the box 
office at (207) 481-0790.

The first concert, on 
October 25 and 26, is titled 
“Heroes: Common and 
Uncommon.” Besides Bee-
thoven’s Symphony No. 3, 
commonly known as the 
“Eroica” or “heroic” sym-
phony, the concert features 
Philip Lima singing Martin 
Luther King Jr.’s “I have a 
Dream” speech in a musi-
cal setting by Lee Hoiby.

In keeping with MSO 
tradition, the January 17 
and 18 program “Myths 
and Magic” consists of 
several shorter pieces de-
signed with the whole fam-
ily in mind, including Tan 

Dun’s intriguing “Passa-
caglia: Secret of Wind and 
Birds,” with a section in 
which the audience plays 
bird sounds over their cell 
phones to accompany the 
orchestra.

The March 21 and 22 
program, called “Ambition 
and Destiny,” will be led 
by one of the orchestra’s 
favorite guest conductors, 
Jinwook Park, who is also 
the conductor of the Colby 
College Orchestra and the 
Augusta Symphony.

The MSO wraps up 
its season on May 16 and 
17 with one of the tower-
ing works of the orchestral 
repertoire, the “Resurrec-
tion” symphony by Mahler, 
featuring chorus and vocal 
soloists, and performed on 
the Saturday night concert 
at the new Donald M. Gay 

Performing Arts Center at 
Edward Little High School 
in Auburn.

The mission of the 
Midcoast Symphony Or-
chestra (MSO) is to pro-
vide an outlet for talent-
ed musicians to study, 
perform, and share their 
love for symphonic music 
through performances and 
educational activities for 
all ages. The 85-member, 
all-volunteer, non-prof-
it, community orchestra 
has been led since 2003 
by music director Rohan 
Smith. MSO’s “More with 
Midcoast” series offers au-
diences the opportunity to 
hear interviews with guest 
artists, try out the instru-
ments for themselves, or 
observe an open rehears-
al on stage with maestro 
Smith.

Best 
Source
for Arts, 

Music and 
Theater!

Your
Hometown Paper.

Gorham reviving Boston Post 
Cane, looking for oldest resident

GORHAM, ME – 
The Town of Gorham is 
reviving the tradition of 
the Boston Post Cane.  We 
are looking for the oldest 
living resident of Gorham.  
The person must have lived 
in the Town of Gorham for 
a minimum of the most 
recent 10-year period and 
must be willing to receive 
the honor.  If you know of 
someone who may qualify, 
please contact the Town 
Clerk’s Office at 207-222-
1670 or visit the Town’s 
website to fill out a nomi-
nation form.

Additional support-
ing documentation may be 
required. Nomination pa-
pers will be available until 
September 30, 2025.

Follow us on Facebook
www.facebook.com/GorhamWeekly
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Call, Text or 
Chat 988

  988 crisis hotline offers free and 
confidential support available 24/7.

Maine to pilot Outdoor School for All

Youth learn about invasive green crabs, including how to 
cook, crack and eat them, during an October 2024 fishing 
activity at the 4-H Camp and Learning Center at Blueber-
ry Cove. Photo courtesy of University of Maine Cooperative 
Extension. 

FENN PARK

Mini Golf - Disc Golf 

Driving Range

+207-998-4351 

547 Maine St., Poland Spring

www.polandspringresort.com

Poland Spring Resort

ICE CREAM SHOP

20+ FLAVORS 

GIFFORD’S ICE CREAM

PRO SHOP

18-Hole Golf Course

4 Pickleball Courts

3 Grass Tennis Courts

MEL’S HILLTOP RESTAURANT

LUNCH, DINNER, DRINKS

OPEN DAILY 11:30 AM - 9 PM

+207-998-�002

37 Robbins Rd., Poland Spring

www.polandspringresort.com

Open to the Public

Try our Double

Smash Burger!

BRYANT POND, 
ME – Thousands of Maine 
students will participate in 
transformative overnight 
outdoor educational ex-
periences in the coming 
school year — at no cost 
to their districts.  

Maine Outdoor 
School for All is launching 
this fall thanks to $450,000 
secured from private foun-
dations, including the Bet-
terment Fund, Horizon 
Foundation and Quimby 
Family Foundation, and 
bipartisan legislation es-
tablishing the program 
sponsored by state Sen. 
Rick Bennett and signed 

into law in May by Gov. 
Janet Mills. 

The program will be 
administered by Universi-
ty of Maine Cooperative 
Extension, which will 
make grants to certified 
outdoor learning centers, 
enabling them to provide 
students in grades four 
through eight immersive, 
three-day, two-night out-
door educational experi-
ences.

About one-fifth of 
Maine public school stu-
dents already participate 
in overnight programming 
through the organizations 
that make up the Maine 

Outdoor School for All co-
alition, including UMaine 
Extension’s 4-H Learning 
Centers, the Chewonki 
Foundation, the Ecology 
School and Schoodic In-
stitute, typically paid for 
by the sending district or 
private foundations. 

With the establish-
ment of the program in 
state statute, initial private 
funding and a campaign to 
raise an additional $1 mil-
lion this year, Maine has 
become one of just four 
states committed to pro-
viding outdoor learning 
opportunities for all public 
school students, regardless 

of the socioeconomic sta-
tus of their family or their 
district. Oregon, Washing-
ton and Minnesota have 
Outdoor School for All 
programs funded by lot-
tery proceeds and appro-
priations.

At current funding 
levels, UMaine Exten-
sion expects the program 
will serve 1,000 addition-
al students in 2025-26. 
When fully funded at $6 
million annually, the pro-
gram will be accessible 
to all students in grades 
four through eight in the 
state. Extension will cer-
tify outdoor education 
programs across the state 
and issue grant funding for 
these programs to partner 
with school administrative 
units and provide immer-
sive outdoor education.

“There is no better 
classroom than the Maine 
outdoors,” said Executive 
Director of UMaine Ex-
tension 4-H Centers Ry-
der Scott. “Research has 
reinforced that outdoor 
learning benefits students’ 
academic performance 
and their physical and 
social-emotional wellbe-
ing. These aren’t just field 
trips — they are transfor-
mational experiences that 
engage Maine students in 
exciting STEM learning 
and prepare them for fu-
ture success in their stud-
ies and careers.”

While at the certified 
outdoor learning centers, 
students and their teachers 
will participate in hands-
on discovery aligned with 
state learning results. The 
core curriculum will help 
students develop in-de-
mand STEM, leadership, 
communication and col-
laboration skills, while 
fostering confidence, con-
nection to the state’s out-
door heritage and a com-
mitment to environmental 
stewardship. This is en-
tirely consistent with the 
goals and strategies of the 
recently released 10-Year 
Maine Outdoor Recre-
ation Economy Roadmap, 
which proposes expand-
ing pipelines to rewarding 
careers in the outdoor in-
dustry through “increasing 
access to outdoor expe-
riences” and “integrating 
outdoor education and 
career pathways in K-12 
curricula.”

“Our outdoor school 
experiences make a mean-
ingful difference in the 
academic and social-emo-
tional learning for our stu-
dents,” said Woodstock 
Elementary Principal Beth 
Clarke about her students’ 
immersive learning at the 
UMaine 4-H Learning 
Center in western Maine. 
“Whether observing the 
life cycle of plants, un-
derstanding ecosystems 
or learning leadership 
skills, Outdoor School at 
Bryant Pond deepens our 
students’ understanding 

of the world and helps 
them grow into successful 
young adults.

“Extension is thrilled 
to play a key leadership 
role in the Outdoor School 
program,” said UMaine 
Extension Dean Hannah 
Carter. “This program will 
create pathways for stu-
dents to attend Maine’s 
public universities and 
help build a labor force 
skilled in resource man-
agement, conservation, 
outdoor recreation, agri-
culture and forestry.”

“Outdoor immersive 
education allows all its 
participants the opportu-
nity to grow academically 
and socially. It allows stu-
dents to practice healthy 
risk taking, and it shows 
them a world beyond cell 
phones and social media,” 
said 2025 Maine Teacher 
of the Year Becky Hallow-
ell, who incorporates out-
door teaching and learn-
ing into her fourth grade 
at Wiscasset Elementary 
School. “All our Maine 
students deserve to have 
this opportunity.” 

“Research shows 
the critical years around 
middle school are a key 
window for physical, so-
cial and mental health 
development and the data 
shows that Maine youth 
are facing more mental 
health challenges than 
ever before. These mid-
dle school years are when 
kids start thinking about 
possible career pathways 
and their beliefs about 
the place they call home,” 
said Maine Environmen-
tal Education Association 
Executive Director Olivia 
Griset. “When our youth 
get to have positive com-
munity-based learning 
experiences they gain a 
greater sense of place and 
connection to this state, 
making it more likely they 
will want to stay here to 
pursue careers, contribute 
to the Maine economy, 
raise their families, and 
participate in their local 
communities.”

“Current funding 
formulas for public edu-
cation simply do not allow 
schools that would most 
benefit from this type of 
experience to pay for it 
out of their normal oper-
ating budgets, especially 
schools in rural, low-in-
come or remote parts of 
the state. And yet, these 
very students are often the 
ones we are depending on 

to lead our fishing, farm-
ing and forest industries 
in the future, and hope 
they develop an interest 
in the sustainable resource 
management so crucial to 
Maine’s economy,” said 
the Chewonki Founda-
tion’s Nancy Kennedy. 

“This new Outdoor 
School program creates a 
framework for improved 
access to robust outdoor 
learning programs for 
students in our poorer 
and more rural areas,” 
said Cobscook Institute 
Co-Executive Director 
Shaun Haskins. “Making 
this a statewide initiative, 
rather than something 
that individual schools or 
school districts must man-
age to implement on their 
own, reduces barriers and 
builds opportunity for all 
of our youth to reap the 
benefits of these amazing 
programs.”

“This is a win for 
Maine students,” said 
Ecology School Presi-
dent Drew Dumsch. “We 
know from decades of 
experience that outdoor 
education is a powerful 
spark that keeps kids en-
gaged in hands-on learn-
ing, STEM-related stud-
ies and, most importantly, 
gives them a window into 
Maine’s distinct landscape 
and natural heritage — 
from working forests and 
tidal estuaries to agricul-
ture, conservation and 
fisheries. Now we must 
secure full and ongoing 
funding so all of our kids 
can benefit.”

To learn more about 
supporting Maine Out-
door School, contact Ry-
der Scott at ryder.scott@
maine.edu.
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Discover The Truth About CDs!   
CD Interest Rates Are At An All Time Low. 

There IS A Safe, Guaranteed Alternative To 
Increase Your Income.  

                                            Call now for a FREE Guide:   

“10 Secrets Your Banker Doesn’t 
Want You To Know” 

 Call Our 24 Hour Order Line  @782-3800 

Discover The Truth About CDs!   
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Discover The Truth About CDs!   
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There IS A Safe, Guaranteed Alternative To 
Increase Your Income.  

                                            Call now for a FREE Guide:   

“10 Secrets Your Banker Doesn’t 
Want You To Know” 

 Call Our 24 Hour Order Line  @782-3800 

ACCOUNTANT

CHIROPRACTOR

PRINTING

Family Chiropractic Center

1485 Lisbon Street, Lewiston

207.783.0078
www.familychirome.com



Experience Life

23 Goldthwaite Rd. 
Auburn, ME 04210

PO Box 715 
Lewiston, ME 04243

AUBURN SELF STORAGE, LLC

PHONE 376-3325  

Auburn 207-783-9111   Norway 207-743-7777
AustinPA.com

Your Financial Team

SHIPPING

SELF STORAGE

Computer Diagnostics • Yokohama Tires
Repairs • Alignments • Inspection Station

Gas • Clear K1 • Tune-ups • Brakes • Batteries

260 S. Main St., Auburn • 782-9144 

Dan & Don Poisson
dfpoisson@aol.com

Poisson & Sons 
Auto Care Center, Inc.

The Only Full-Service Gas Station in Auburn!

AUTO CARE

PAINTING

9 N. River Road in Auburn ~ www.AuburnGoinPostal.com ~ 784-9900

MARINE SERVICES

Locally Owned

Marine Service

237 Lewiston Road • Topsham, ME 04086 • (207) 725-5997
www.pontesmarine.com

American 
Builders

Call 207-500-8100
For FREE Estimates

Quality Work with References Available

Custom Building & Remodeling

Fully Insured • 5 Year Workmanship Warranty

Call Tyler
500-8100

Finish Carpenter

CONTRACTORS

Interiors • Exteriors
Free Estimates

WADE J. LIBBY
WJLibbyPainting@gmail.com

Drywall Repair
Pressure Washing

CELL: 207.210.0605

FREE DELIVERY L/A

777-1520
www.sweetpeafloraldesignsme.com

Sweet Pea Des igns
FLOWER SHOPPE

FLOWER SHOPPE

PHOTOGRAPHY WEB HOSTING

CD’S

Executive Portraits • Business photographs • Videos

Bell Studios, Inc.

PHOTOGRAPHY

MASONRY
Jason Hodsdon

JasonHodsdonMasonry@gmail.com

Masonry • Culture Stones
Chimneys • Chimney Cleaning

Repointing & Repairs
Restoration

Stainless Steel Liners

North Monmouth
(207) 215-3557

Fully Insured 
Free Estimates

20+ Years of Experience

Business Directory

Contact us today for possible openings in our 
business directory! Info@TwinCitytimes.com.

RICK OSGOOD 
owner

207-782-0525 
phone

Full Service Commercial Printer 
Color & B/W Printing & Copying

Large Format • Posters 
Booklets • Carbonless Forms

Letterheads • Envelopes 
Business Cards • Labels • Tags 

Design Service • and More!

2 Great Falls Plaza, Suite 1B  
Auburn ME 04210
info@evergreencustomprinting.com

EVERGREEN
CUSTOM PRINTING, INC.

SPACE AVAILABLE
Your ad
HERE!

Call 795-5017
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GORHAM LITTLE LEAGUEGORHAM LITTLE LEAGUE    
Field Funding CampaignField Funding Campaign

GYBSA is a non-profit 501(c)(3) tax deductible contribution

GORHAM LITTLE LEAGUE  
Field Funding Campaign
The Gorham Youth Baseball & Softball Association is making a large capital investment 
to provide updates and add fields to accommodate practice and game schedules:

          - Develop 2 fields at White Rock

          - Purchase seasonal fence for Shaw Park

          - Repair dugouts and fencing, build storage centers

          - Add infield mix and relevel current fields

          - Acquire tarps and field maintenance equipment

          - Add scoreboards

VISIT: GYBSA.COM FOR MORE INFORMATION, INCLUDING DONATION LEVEL REWARDS

$20K

$50K

DONATE TODAY!

$40K

$30K

VISIT: tinyurl.com/GYBSA-DONATE or 
MAIL TO: GYBSA, PO Box 176, Gorham, ME 04038

Calendar
Send your submissions to the Editor. More online.

Sept-Oct
WEST GARDINER – 

The Center for Maine Craft 
is pleased to announce the 
opening of A New Chap-
ter, a compelling two-artist 
exhibition featuring prints 
and original mixed media 
artwork by Larry Clifford 
and handcrafted furniture 
by Brian Haddock of Ru-
ral Modern Furniture. The 
show runs from September 
2 through October 26, 2025.

Sept 5
WATERVILLE – The 

September 5 opening is pre-
sented as part of Waterville’s 
First Friday, a monthly cele-
bration of the arts and busi-
ness in downtown Water-
ville. This First Friday will 
take the form a block party, 
with Main Street closed be-
tween Temple and Spring 
Streets. Waterville Creates 
is partnering with the Col-
by College Museum of Art, 
Elm City Music School, 
Discover Waterville, and 
other partners to bring fun, 
free programs for all ages. 
All are welcome Friday, 
September 5, 5–7pm.

Sept 6
AUBURN – The 

Maine Iris Society is hav-
ing its public auction of Si-
berian Iris and Daylilies on 
Saturday, September 6, at 1 
pm at the United Methodist 
Church, 439 Park Avenue, 
Auburn.  This is a public 
auction where members 
and non-members can ob-
tain Maine garden grown 
Siberian irises and daylilies. 
https://www.facebook.com/
maineirissociety.

Sept 6
MAINE – Beethoven 

and Korngold: A Journey 
from Heroic Classicism to 
Hollywood Romance.

Saturday September 6 
3:00 pm Brunswick Unitar-
ian Universalist Church, 1 
Middle St., Brunswick.

For additional infor-
mation and tickets go to 
www.dapontequartet.org.

Tuesdays, Sept 9, 16, 
30 and Oct 7, 14, 21

AUBURN – Auburn 
Public Library:  Fall Slow 
Flow Yoga  to be taking 
place on Tuesdays, Septem-
ber 9th, 16th, 30th and Oc-
tober 7th, 14th, 21st, 2025 
from 4:30 to 5:30 PM.

Starting Sept 10, 2nd 
and 4th Wednesdays

LEWISTON – The 
Lewiston Public Library, 
in partnership with ArtVan, 
will be offering in-person art 
programs. Starting on Sep-
tember 10th, the programs 
will take place on the 2nd 
and 4th Wednesday of every 
month from 3:30pm-5:00pm 
in the Children’s Depart-
ment for children ages 5-14. 
Make Art with ArtVan is 
free, open to the public, and 
no registration is required. 
All art supplies will be pro-
vided.

Sept 12
LEWISTON – The 

Lewiston Contradance  se-

ries  at Trinity Commons 
will kick off its new Fall 
season on Friday September 
12.   The dance, which runs 
from 7:30 to 10 is always 
preceded  at 7 with a work-
shop for people who would 
like to learn contradance 
basics before the program, 
during which the dances are 
taught and called to live mu-
sic.

Sept 12
LEWISTON – At 

10am the Lewiston Public 
Library Children’s Depart-
ment will be offering the 
program Baby Footprints 
Keepsakes. Caregivers and 
their infants will be able 
to create a baby footprints 
keepsake using the imprints 
of their children’s feet on 
salt dough. This activity is 
recommended for caregiv-
ers with children ages 0-24 
months old.

Sept 14
NEW GLOUCESTER 

– The Friends of the New 
Gloucester Public Library 
are pleased to invite the 
community to their annual 
Fall Book and Bake Sale 
on Sunday, September 14, 
2025, from 12:00 to 3:00 
p.m. at the New Gloucester 
Community Building locat-
ed at 381 Intervale Road. A 
members-only preview sale 
will be held that day from 
11:00 a.m. to 12:00 p.m.

Sept 16
TOPSHAM – “Troll-

ing for Maine’s Trout & 
Salmon: The Good, The 
Bad, The Ugly” Merrymeet-
ing Bay Trout Unlimited 
Public Meeting at Sea Dog 
Brewing, 1 Bowdoin Mill 
Island, Topsham, 6:00-8:00 
pm.

Sept 17
MAINE – St. Mary’s 

Vein Care will host a free 
screening event for vari-
cose veins and circulation 
concerns from 10:00 a.m. 
to 12:00 p.m. Appointments 
are required, with time slots 
available every 10 minutes. 
To schedule an appointment, 
call (207) 777-4469.

Sept 20
WESTBROOK – The 

Friends of Feral Felines 
22nd annual book sale is 
coming to Westbrook again 
this year, to the very popu-
lar Westbrook Community 
Center at 426 Bridge Street.   
The sale will run from 9am 
to 2pm on Saturday, Sep-
tember 20.  There will be 
hundreds of books, includ-
ing top titles and great pric-
es!

Sept 25, Oct 16, Nov 
13

MAINE – The 2025 
Maine Hire-A-Vet is a state-
wide effort with the goal 
of at least 100 employers 
hiring at least 100 veterans 
and military family mem-
bers during a 100-day pe-
riod. While the campaign 
is focused on veterans and 
their families, these events 
are open to ALL jobseekers!

September 25, 2025 | 

11:00 am to 3:00 pm | Uni-
versity of Maine-Orono.

October 16, 2025 | 
11:00 am to 3:00 pm | Maine 
Sports Arena, Saco.

November 13, 2025 | 
11:00 am to 3:00 pm | Uni-
versity of Maine-Farming-
ton.

Oct 4-5
CANAAN – Maine’s 

Garlic Fest  returns this Oc-
tober 4th & 5th, 2025  at 
Lake George Regional Park 
in Canaan, Maine!

Oct 18
LEWISTON – Party 

like it’s 1813! Join us at the 
Lewiston Public Library’s 
Jane Austen Regency Ball, 
doors will open at 6:30pm, 
and the dance will run from 7 
to 9pm. The ball will include 
English Country Dancing 
and light refreshments. This 
is the Lewiston Public Li-
brary’s first annual literary 
ball, commemorating Jane 
Austen’s 250th birthday.

Oct 25, 26
MAINE – The Mid-

coast Symphony Orchestra 

presents “Heroes: Common 
and Uncommon” Rohan 
Smith, Conductor.

Saturday, October 25, 
2025 - 7:00 p.m. - Franco 
Center in Lewiston.

Sunday, October 26, 
2025 - 2:30 p.m. - Orion 
Performing Arts Center in 
Topsham.

Aaron Copland: Fan-
fare for the Common Man; 
Giuseppe Verdi: Overture to 
Vespri Siciliani; Lee Hoiby: 
I have a Dream (featuring 
Philip Lima, baritone solo-
ist); Spiritual Medley (fea-
turing Philip Lima, baritone 
soloist); Ludwig van Bee-
thoven: Symphony No. 3, 
“Eroica”.

Nov 15
LEWISTON – Prince 

of Peace Parish Christmas 
Craft Fair Saturday, from 
9-3.   Looking for craft-
ers/artists at Holy Family 
Church Hall 607 Sabattus 
St., Lewiston. Prices for 
tables/spaces range from 
$25-$40!  Contact Angela at 
adobson@une.edu.
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Send payment with completed form to our bookkeeping office:  
89 Union Street, Suite 1014 Auburn, ME 04210 or email it to us!

FOR SALE
All-in-one Dell printer and 
fax machine. $495. Call 
783-8327.
Wood boiler – Must go! 
$2,500. Alternate heating 
carbon steel wood boil-
er. Purchased in 1996 for 
$6,800. New door seal, 
bricks, blanket, and sili-
cone card bead. Includes 
cycle timer and plumb fit-
tings. 1,400#. Model E100 
wood gun. Can be lifted di-
rectly into your trailer.

HOUSE KEEPING

Housekeeping/ House 
Arranging small items 
to aid in mobility. Small 
jobs/spring cleaning and 
removal of unwanted items. 
Scheduled regularly and 
ongoing. (207) 705-7989 
 

LIVE & CODE 
IN MAINE

Maine cybersecurity start-
up seeks local software 
engineer
Defendify is looking for a 
senior full stack engineer to 
join full-time. Small team/
big results. Fun + flexible 
+ always interesting. Come 
build our award-winning, 
all-in-one cybersecurity 
platform. Position informa-
tion and to apply: www.de-

Classified Ads
CAMPER 

FOR SALE
Keystone campfire edition 
travel trailer. New June 
2018. 29.8 feet. Less than 
500 miles on it. 12 foot 
slide out, large refrigerator, 
leather couch. Two gray 
water tanks, large closets, 
over $9000 extras. AC/
furnace. Paid $34,000 new. 
Must sell. Asking $21,000. 
207–310–0212.

Keystone Sprinter 5th 
Wheel. 2018, 31 feet, 
2  super  s l ides ,  la rge 
refrigerator, like new - hardly 
used. Full winter cover, 
super glide included. Asking 
$25,500 - please call 207-
754-2165

CAREGIVER
FULL TIME Caregiver. 
Professional Female Seeks 
Fami ly  That  Needs a 
Fulltime Caregiver For Their 
Young Children / Special 
Needs / Elder Person to do 
care in their home! Call 207-
352-8478 Monday - Friday 
Preferred - Would consider 
4-10 hour days.

CLEANING
NORTHERN SUPREME 
CLEANING. Junk removal 
• Yard cleanup. Everything 
& anything! Residential 
&  C o m m e r c i a l  O u r 
team ensures spotless, 
refreshed spaces with 
eco- f r iend ly  pract ices 
and competitive pricing. 
*Trust us for a superior 
c lean ing exper ience!* 
Call (207) 595-6347 or 
email Northernsupreme 
cleaning@gmail.com 

C o m m e r c i a l  O f f i c e 
Cleaning .  1s t  Cho ice 
F loor  Care & Bui ld ing 
Maintenance. Commercial 
cleaning company with 25+ 
years experience and fully 
insured. 1 day a week or 
more we can do it all. Call, 
email or text. (207) 956-
3114 stephen@1stcoice 
f l o o r c a r e . c o m 
www.1stchoicefloorcare.com

EDUCATION
Enjoy American History 
Download free ebooks 
from Ebooksforstudents.
o r g .  E n j o y  e x c i t i n g 
narratives about World 
War II, Korea and Vietnam. 
Read about the Freedom 
Rides, the discovery of 
penicillin and how women 
won the right to vote.

fendify.com/careers.

REAL ESTATE 
WANTED

Seeking house , cottage, 
bungalo, two or three 
family property, we have 
sufficient ability to pur-
chace quickly, no commi-
sions. 207-749-1718 or 
mainebuyers@gmail.com

SEWING, 
MENDING

CAN MAKE IT FIT 
Sewing, mending: Shirts, 
pants, coats, nightgowns, 
curtains. Most anything 
that needs fixing. Buttons, 
T-shirts $10 for machine 
sewn, $20 for hand sewn. 
Call 929-1038 

SENIOR TRIPS
If interested in any of the 
following trips or upcom-
ing trips, please contact 
Claire Bilodeau at 784-
0302 or Cindy Boyd at 
345-9569.  If we are not 
available, please leave a 
message and we will call 
you as soon as we can.

SEPTEMBER 15 - 18, 
2025 - THE GRAND 
CANYON OF PENNSYL-
VANIA - Trip includes 3 
nights lodging, 3 break-

fasts and 3 dinners in-
cluding the historic Pe-
ter Herdic House and 
The Carriage House.  
Highlights of this tour 
are Susquehanna Riv-
er Cruise, Pennsylvania 
Grand Canyon Wagon 
Tour, Millionaires Row 
Tour, Thomas Taber Mu-
seum, Historic Rowley 
House and much more.  
A $75.00 deposit is due 
upon signing up.  Price 
of this trip is $769.00 pp 
double occupancy and 
$918.00 for a single. Fi-
nal payment is due July 
17, 2025. 

OCTOBER 6 – 10, 2025 
– ATLANTIC CITY, 
CAPE MAY, & PHILA-
DELPHIA  - Trip includes 
5 days and 4 nights lodg-
ing, 4 breakfasts and 4 
dinners and a free casino 
bonus for those who want 
to gamble. 
Guided tour of Philadel-
phia including Liberty 
Bell, Independence Hall, 
Betsy Ross House, the 
Federal Reserve and 
Mint. Then off to Cape 
May with a Trolley Tour of 
the Victorian Mansions of 
Cape May and a walking 
tour of a historic Victori-
an Home.  We travel to 
Cape May Point and the 
famous Cape May Light-
house.  Our next day is a 
free day in Atlantic City to 
do as you please.  Take in 

a show, do some gaming 
or just stroll down Atlan-
tic City’s Famous Board-
walk.  A $75.00 deposit 
per person is due upon 
signing up.  The price 
for this trip is $849.00 
per person double oc-
cupancy.  Add $210.00 
for single occupancy.  
Final Payment is due 
7/30/25.

NOVEMBER 16-26, 2025 
– CLASSICAL GREECE  
- Price includes round 
trip air from Logan In-
ternational Airport, hotel 
transfers and all transpor-
tation while on tour.  Trip 
also includes 16 meals (9 
breakfasts, 1 luncheon, 
and 6 dinners). 
Highlights of this tour are 
Athens, the Acropolis and 
Parthenon, Delphi, Olym-
pia and Ancient Mycenae.
You will visit a Greek 
Farm, have a Cooking 
Class, Greek Dance 
Class, and visit two re-
mote monasteries.  We 
will also have a tasting of 
local wines, olive oil and 
sweets.

APRIL 14 - 22, 2026 - 
HOLLAND AND BEL-
GIUM SPRINGTIME 
CRUISE - Trip includes 9 
days and 20 meals. High-
lights are 7 Night River 
Cruise, Amsterdam with 
Canal Cruise, Keukenhof 
Gardens, Middelburg, 

Belgium Waterways, Sce-
nic Sail, Bruges, Antwerp, 
Kinderdijk Windmills.  
Ship is the MS Amade-
us Brilliant.  Included in 
price is round trip air from 
Logan International Air-
port and all Hotel Trans-
fers.  Deposit is $898.00 
pp plus $699.00 if you 
want travel protection.  
Rates vary depending on 
the cabin category you 
choose.  
  
SEPTEMBER 20 - 28, 
2026 - DISCOVER 
PAINTED CANYONS 
OF THE WEST - Trip 
includes 9 days and 11 
meals.  Highlights are 
Colorado National Park, 
Wine tasting in the midst 
of Colorado Wine Coun-
try.  Moab, Arches Nation-
al Park, Canyonlands Na-
tional Park, Dead Horse 
Point State Park, Capitol 
Reef State Park, Bryce 
Canyon National Park 
and Zion National Park 
all in Utah, last day in Ve-
gas.  Included in price is 
round trip air from Logan 
International Airport and 
all Hotel Transfers.  De-
posit is $698.00 pp plus 
$429.00 if you want travel 
protection.
If you are interested in 
any of these trips or 
for more information, 
please contact Claire 
at 784-0302 or Cindy at 
345-9569.



Page 16 Thursday, September 4, 2025

Insulate.  
Be comfortable.  
Save money.
Act now while rebates up to 
$8,000 are available*

* All homeowners eligible for rebates up to $4,000. Verified income-eligible    
  homeowners qualify for rebates up to $8,000. See efficiencymaine.com for details.

Find an insulation professional  
at efficiencymaine.com
or call 866-376-2463.

Experience the magic of our community firsthand when 
you join us for an afternoon of mystery and delight. 
Sip and savor our signature drinks and appetizers as 
you tap your toes to enchanting music, uncover the 
mystery in a special activity, and get a glimpse into 
our vibrant lifestyle. Whether you don a mask or 
not, we invite you to raise a glass with us at the 
celebration of the year!

RSVP today at 207-579-8007 or visit 
SLCMAGICALMASQUERADE.COM

A MAGICAL

50 NEW PORTLAND RD. | GORHAM, ME 04038

MasqueradeMasquerade

Independent Living | Assisted Living | Memory Care 
Skilled Nursing & Rehabilitation

fridayfriday september 1212 3 p3 p..MM..

1 Annual Percentage Rate as of 7/18/2025. Rates subject to change without notice. Not all 
applicants will qualify for the lowest rate or be approved. Advertised rate is based on risk 

based & relationship pricing discounts. For more information, visit egcu.org/rec.

egcu.org/rec

Rec Loans
Scan to apply

or call
207-221-5000

Rates as low as

55 ..4949 APR1
%

Follow us on Facebook
www.facebook.com/GorhamWeekly




